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Introduction 
 
 

You have a great idea for a business. It can be tempting to jump right in and start selling, but before you 
do, there are questions you should ask yourself.  This workbook will take you through some questions 
you need to answer as you are preparing to start a business selling a product. 
 
You might not know all the answers the first time you go through this workbook. That’s okay. Answer 
what you can and write down what you still need to research or figure out.  That will help you determine 
your next steps and be more prepared to face the challenges of starting a new business.  
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What is Your Big Idea? 
 

The first thing to ask yourself is what you are going to sell.  What is your big idea?  How is your service 
unique from other businesses? What makes it special?  
 
Why will people want to use your service? What problem or need does your service address? 
 
Be specific as you answer these questions. Your service should have something about it that makes it 
stand out.  
 
 
 
For example:   
I want to have a window washing business. There aren’t very many businesses like that in my area and 
there a lot of people who work at demanding jobs that would be able to afford and want a window 
washing service to keep their house looking nice. I will stand out with excellent customer service and 
being able to get them on the schedule really quickly, maybe even the same day.  

 

My big idea is: 

My next steps: 
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Who Is Your Customer? 
 

You may have an amazing idea, but if no one buys it, it isn’t going to be a profitable business.  Who 
exactly are you trying to sell to? What type of person, specifically, will benefit or be attracted to your 
business?   
 
How will you be able to reach those people?  Consider ways that you can get access to the people who 
want to use your service. If you have a mobile service, how will you advertise for customers? If you’re 
advertising online, how will you get in front of customers who would be interested in your service? How 
will people know how to look for you specifically?  If you have a storefront, consider the cost of the 
facility and utilities, as well as how many hours each week you’ll need to be open.  If you have a 
storefront, you may need to be open over 40 hours a week.  
 
 
For example:  
My customers will probably mostly be people with limited free time, or people who don’t feel 
comfortable getting up on a ladder to wash their own windows.  I think older people or people who are 
working a lot and live in a nice house. I will serve people who live within 30 minutes of my house and I’ll 
advertise but I will need to figure out how.  

 
 
 
 

My customers are: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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How Much Will You Sell Your Service For? 
 
Your service has something that makes it stand apart from the others, but there are still a lot of similar 
businesses.  Who are they? Determine who else is selling something similar. Where do they sell it?   
 
Have you determined how to price your own service in relation to your competitors? Check out other 
companies and think about your service. What price can you charge?  Also think about the cost of 
providing your service and what price you will need to cover your costs and make a profit.   
 
As you are thinking about the price you will charge, consider how your service is similar and different 
from your competitors. What is your advantage- what do you have or what can you do that the others 
cannot? How will you be successful selling in a market with your competition? 
 
 
 
For example: There aren’t very many other businesses that do residential window washing and they are 
more expensive and harder to get an appointment with than I will be. I can be successful by charging a 
little less and having appointments sooner and having excellent quality and customer service. 
 
 

 
 
 
 

Who are your competitors: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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Who is on Your Business Team? 
 

When you are starting a business, a support system is very helpful.  Do you have partners or a team of 
people you’re going to be working with? Do you have people who can mentor your or give you advice? 
Do you have the support of family and friends? 
 
 
For example: I will be working on my own but my parents are supportive and good at talking through 
ideas. I have other friends who have started businesses and will give me advice.   
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

My business team is: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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What Will You Need to Get Started? 
 

What kind of equipment or training will you need to get started? Do you need transportation to provide 
your service or a location where customers will come to you?  What about marketing costs?  
 
Make a list of the things you will need to be able to get started.  How much money will those things 
cost? Make sure you consider all the costs you’ll incur and things you’ll need to buy.  
 
 
For example: I will need ladders, cleaning supplies, and maybe an extension pole. I’ll also need to figure 
out marketing. I already have a truck that I can use to transport the ladder and supplies to the job. 
Ongoing, it will cost a little bit in gas to go around to each job and I’ll need to replace cleaning solution 
and towels as needed. 
 
Start up costs: 
 

Ladder 100 
Extension Pole 40 
Cleaning solution 40 
Buckets 15 
Squeegees 15 
Cloths/Towels 40 
Marketing 100 
Licensing 50 
  
Total Needed 400 

My start-up needs are: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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Where Can I Get Financing? 
 

It is important to consider what your financing options are for starting a new business.  If you don’t 
have, or can’t get, the money to get started, you won’t be able to get your business going. 
 
Can you get started without borrowing any money? 
 
Do you have personal assets, such as a home or savings, that you would be willing to risk? 
 
Do you have family or partners willing to finance you? If so, what will happen to relationship if the 
money is lost? Will you relationship survive if you can’t pay back the money? 
 
Do you have a great relationship with your banker?  
 
 
 For example: I can use my savings to get started and shouldn’t need to borrow any money.  
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

My financing options are: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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When Can I Start Selling? 
 

Once you’ve considered all that you need to get to be able to start your service business, consider when 
you can start selling.  Do you need any training before you start?  If so, how long will that take?  How 
long will it take to get business licensing or marketing in place?  Do you need to wait until a certain time 
of year to begin selling, like if you are planning on providing a seasonal service like lawn mowing? 
 
 
 For example: I should be ready to start as soon as I can get my legal stuff in place. I have some family 
who would hire me right now while I get the marketing going.  
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

I can start selling: 
 
 

My next steps: 
 



11 
 

What Licensing and Other Regulations Do I Need to Comply With? 
 

Different types of businesses have different regulations and required licensing.  You need a state tax 
number.  You will need to register with the Utah Department of Commerce.  You will also need to 
register with the county or city in which you are operating.  Each location will have different 
requirements; for example, some rural unincorporated counties just require you to inform them you are 
in business and don’t charge a fee.  Others require fees and more extensive paperwork.  

If you have employees, you will have additional steps at the both the state and federal level that you’ll 
need to comply with.  You will need to get an employer identification number (EIN) from the Internal 
Revenue Service. 

Certain business have additional regulations and requirements.  You will need to be sure you are in 
compliance with the federal, state, and local regulations for your specific location and product.  

 

For example: I know I’ll need to register for a tax number with the state. I’ll also need to find out from the 
city what I need to do for that. I’m not hiring any employees at this time. I don’t think that jewelry sales 
have special licensing or requirements, but I’ll need to double check. 
 

 
 
 

My required licensing: 
 
 

My next steps: 
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Each of these questions are important to consider when evaluating your business idea.  These 
concepts are the building blocks to investigate and think about the important factors.  Once you have 
considered these items, here are some next steps. 
 
You need to put together your overall plan and make sure that, as a whole, it can be a viable business.  
Using the information from these questions, you can consult a business advisor, such as services 
available at Small Business Development Centers.  They can help you develop and refine your overall 
business plan and examine the viability of the business as a whole. 
 
 
For more information can be found at https://business.utah.gov/business-resources/. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://business.utah.gov/business-resources/
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